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he past weekend we held the yearly WS for 
blessed families and members. We welcomed 
40 adults and 10 children. People came from all 

over Portugal, representing also Porto and Lousada 
community. The WS lasted 2 days and the lectures 
were presented by different brothers. We heard 
about relationship within blessed family, Creationism 
vs. Evolution, personal testimonies about developing 
business and selling True Fathers autobiography, etc. 

The different kinds of presentation maintained our 
curiosity alert and our spirit high. Meeting people 
after so long time also contributed to the spirit of the 
WS.  

We had a roundtable or brainstorming about various 
themes as witnessing, tribal messiahship, developing 
the community, second generation.  

We had two groups and communicated in the end 
the ideas and propositions. Of course the hard part 
comes now, to practice and bring result, but it was a 
very good start.  

In the end each could receive a holy candle and holy 
salt as well as witnessing materials. Also we invested 
in the good time, we watched the movie Winter Tale 
and had very good meals. Altogether was a very nice 
experience and a great occasion to make unity as a 
family. 

Thank You, all the best to all ITPN. 

Sérgio Neto
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